To:

Page 7 of 26

FROM:

BID FOR:

2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT)

120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 2 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention:  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Diviston of Resolutions and Receiverships

Mevada Siate Bank, Las Vegas, Nevada

Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Elko, NV {ihe "Buank™

The undersigned Potenuial Acquirer submits this Bid Form {"Bid™), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acguirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire cortain assets and labilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption (Whole Bank) with

Loss Share Agreement.

Maodule | — Whole Bank w/
Version 1.0}
February 28, 2009

Losg Share — Bid Form 1 Great Basin Bank of Nevada

Elko, NV



To: Page 8 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This ig bid number 1
of 2 bids submitted.

i Tranasaction # 1 - Al Deposits

The Potential Acquirer is:  Nevada State Bank, Las Vegas, Nevada
{(Name, City, Stuile)

The asset premium (discount) bid must be stated as a dollar amount. The Deposit preminm bid
must be stated as a percentage. Bids may be slated as a positive or as a negative mumber. When
compicting the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative bid by placing
parenthesis "( 3" around the numnber. Bids will be considered positive if not in parenthests. If no
bid s made for a ransaction or option, leave the space blank or write "no bid". If one of the two
components s filled in and the other is blank, the bid will be treated as a live bid with abid of' 0
in the blank. A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a live bid of 30 or 0%,

The asset preminm (discount) bid is: 3 (20,990,000

The Deposit premium bid is:* 3.800%, subject to nete ** below

*AH Deposits will be assumed, but the bid is calculated on ¢nly certain deposiis per the bid
instructions.

** The Deposit premium bid is the lesser of 3.806(% or the percentace calculated by
dividing $4.860.006 by the actual dollars of deposits to which the deposit premium bid is
applied: in other words, the Deposit premiuvm is to be effectively capped at 54,860,000, This
hid amount applies to all deposits fo be assumed less assumed brokered deposits, deposis in
assumed CDARS deposit accounts, and assumed Quickrate and other subscription services
deposits. Ne premrium is ofiered with respect fo brokered deposits, assumed CDARS
deposit aecount deposits, and ussumed Quickrate and other subscription services depuosits,

I

Module 1 - Whole Bank w/ Loss Share ~ Bid Form CGireat Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.0 EHes, NV
Febroary 28, 2009



To: Page 9 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This i3 bid number 1
of 2 bids submitied.

. Tranasaction # 2 - [nsured Deposits Only

The Potential Acquirer is:  Nevada State Bank, Las ¥V egas, Nevada
{Name, City, State)

The asset preminm {discount} bid must be stated as a detlar amount. The Deposit premium bid
must be stated as a percentage. Bids may be stated as a positive or as a negative number. When
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative bid by placing
parenthess ()" around the number. Bids will be considered positive if not in parenthesis. Tfno
bid is made for a transaction or option, feave the space blank or write "no bid". {f one of the two
components is filled in apd the other is blank, the bid will be treated as a live bid with a bid of 0
in the blank, A bid of zere in any form will be treated as a live bid of 58 or 0%,

The asset premium (discount) bid is: h]

The Deposit premium bid is:* Y.

*The bid is calcuiated on only certain deposits per the bid instructions.

Module |- Whole Bank w/ Loss Share - Bid Form 3 CGireat Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.01 Elko, NV

February 28, 20609



To:

Page 10 of 26

2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT) 12023799839

This 18 bid number |
of 2 bids submitted.

1, Hesulting Institution Intormation (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)
Al if the Potential Acquirer's Bid is aceepted:

n the resulting financial institution witl be a
bank
 duifi
{11} {he resulting financial mstitution
will

will not

imvolve a de novo nstitution
{1 the resulting financial mstitution

will

will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

Upon consummation of any transaction ¢contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resuiting financial instination involved in the transaction will be

Nevada State Bank

and such mmstitution will be a

national bank

state member bank
state aon member bank
federal savings bank
state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation

Address of holding compuny:  One Seuth Main Street

Maodule | - Whole Bank w/ Loss Share - Bid Form 4 Crreat Basin Bank of Nevada

Version 1.0

February 28, 2009

Elko, NV

From: Brian Alprin



To: Page 11 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number |
of 2 bids submitted.

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:

bank holding company
thrift holding company

Iy. Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title:  Senior Vice President, Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive, Eighth Floor

Qakland, California 94612

Telephone:  510.808.1662 {office)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duanc Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

Vi Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepied, the Poteatial Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Cligibility Cenification ("Certification”) and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not lumited 1o, the

Modulc 1 -- Whole Bank w/ Loss Share — Bid Form 5 Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.01 Elko. NV
February 28, 2009



To:

Page 12 of 26

2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT)

120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 2 bids submitted.

Confidentiality Agreement and its ¢ligibility 1o purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail 1o staie any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if if is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver

to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery,

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Petential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken ali corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (i) the undersigned has been duly authorized to exccute and

submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and avthorizing this represeniative to

sign on behalf of the instinetion or group has been submitted with cach bid form.

Printed Name of Potenfial Acquirer

Nevada State Bank

By:

(signatu’re) 7

Name: Terry A. Shirey

Title: Executive Vice President and

Senior Chief Financial Officer

Date:  April 14, 2009

Module | —~ Whole Bank w/ Loss Share - Bid Form

Version 1.01
February 28, 2009

Cireat Basin Bank of Nevada
Elko, NV



To: Page 13 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This 15 bid number 2
of 2 bids submiited.

EXHIBIT "A”
BID FORM

TO! Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75204

Attentton: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resobutions and Receiverships

FROM: Newvada State Bank, Las Vegas, Nevada

BID FOR: Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Elko, NV (the "Bank"}

The undersigned Potental Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions'} and instructions comained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and labilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption {Whole Bank} with
Loss Share Agreement.

Module 1 — Whole Bank w/ Loss Share - Bid Form i Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.0} Elko, NV
February 28, 2009



To: Page 14 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 2 bids submitted.

L Tranasaction # 1 — All Deposits

The Potential Acquirer is:  Nevada State Bank, Las Vegas, Nevada
(Name, City, State)

The asset premium {discount) bid must be stated as a dollur aiount. The Deposit premiam bid
must be stated as a percentage. Bids may be stated as a positive or as a negative number. When
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers mast indicate a negative bid by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the number. Bids will be considered positive if not in parenthesis. I'no
hid s made for a transaction or option, leave the space blank or write "no bid". 1f ane of the two
components is filled in and the other is blank, the bid will be treated as a live bid with a bid of 0
in the blank. A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a live bid of 30 or 0%,

The asset premium {discount) bid is: & .

The Deposit premium bid is:® Vo,

*All Deposits will be assumed, but the bid is calculated on only certain deposits per the bid
instructions.

Module | — Whole Bank w7/ Loss Share  Bid Form 2 Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.0 Elko, NV
February 28, 2009



To: Page 15 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 2 bids submitted,

IT. Tranasaction # 2 — Insured Deposits Only

The Potential Acquirer is:  Nevada State Bank, Las Vegas, Nevada
{(Name, City, State}

The asset premium (discount) bid must be stated as a dollar amount. The Deposit premium bid
must be stated as a percentage. Bids may be stated as a positive or as a negative number. When
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquivers must indicate a negative bid by placing
parenthesis ()" around the number. Bids wilt be considered positive if not in parenthesis. [fne
bid is made for a transaction or option, leave the space blank or write "no bid”. 1f one of the two
components is filled in and the other is blank, the bid will be weated as a live bid withi a bid of 0
in the blank. A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a live bid of 30 or 8%.

The asset premium (discount) bid is: $ (20,990,000}

The Deposit premivm bid is:* 3.018%, subject to note ** below

*he bid is calculated on only certain deposits per the bid instructions,

** The Deposit premium bid is the lesser of 3.018% or the percentage calculated by
dividing $3.860.000 by the actual dollars of deposits fo which the deposit preminm bid is
applied: in other words, the Deposit premiwm is to be effectively capped at 33,860,800, This
bid amount applies to all deposits to be assumed less asswmed brokered deposits, deposits in
assumned CDARS deposit accounts, and assumed QOuickrate and other subscription services
depasits. Neo premiam is offered with respect to brokered deposits, assumed CDARS
depasit account deposits, and assumed Quickrate and other subscription services deposits,

Module 1 — Whale Bank w/ Loss Share — Bid Form 3 Cireat Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.01 Elko. NV
February 28, 2009



To:

Page 16 of 26

2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT) 12023799838 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 2 bids submitted.

[EER Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate}
A If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:
{1) the resulting financial institution will be a
bank
_____— thrift
{11 the resulting financial mstitution
will

will not

involve a de novo institution
(iil) e resulting financial institution

will

will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemnplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution volved in the transaction will he

Nevada State Bank

and such mstitution will be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other {please explain}

ARRRRCY

C. To be completed anly if 1 holding company is involved:

Name of holding company:  Ziens Bancerporation

Address of holding company:  One South Main Street
Mednic | — Whole Bank w/ Loss Share  Bid Form 4 Great Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.01 Elko, NV
February 28, 2009




To: Page 17 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid pumber 2
of 2 bids submitied.

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be

bank holding company

thrift holding company
1y, Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President, Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakestde Drive. Eighth Floor

Qakland, California 94612

Telephone:  510.808.1662 (office)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc:  Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duanc Momris LLP, 202.776.7820

VI Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notitication {which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will exceute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Eligibility Centification ("Certification”) and that all information provided and
representations made by or an behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the

U

Module | - Whole Bunk w’ Loss Share - Bid Forin Circal Basin Bank of Nevada
Version .01 Elko, NV
February 28. 2009



To: Page 18 of 26 2009-04-14 17:53:19 {GMT) 120237998392 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 2 bids submitted.

Confidentiality Agreement and its eligihility to purchase asscts and ability to exccute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in ali material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it 15 a successtul bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (if) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sign on behalf of the institeetion or group has been submitited with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

Nevada State Bank

By:

=]

(signatute)
Name: Terry A, Shirey

Title: Executive Vice President and
Senior Chief Financial Officer

Date: April 14, 2009

Modute | -~ Whole Bank w/ Loss Share — Bid Form 6 Cireat Basin Bank of Nevada
Version 1.0 Eiko, NV
February 28, 2009





