EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: Torrey Pines Bank *

BID FOR: Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank™)

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilitics pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (i1) a Loan

Sale.

* Torrey Pines bank is a wholly owned subsidiary of Western Alliance Bancorp.



“This is bid number
of bids submitted.

L Parchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: Torrey Pines Bank, San Diego, CA .
(Name, City, State)

The following options arc to be sclected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting_from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquircr to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
liabilitics of the Institution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits to be paid by the FDIC 10 the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilities of the Institution. Discount bids
maust be included in parenthesis "( )"

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits N/A % of Assumed Deposits.
Insured Deposits Only (.00 % of Assumed Deposits.

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise
(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION 1I)

[X] Exercise the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools
[ X] Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
[__] Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assuned that the loan pool bids are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

(] Waive the uption o purchase certain or all Loan Pools

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



This is bid number ____
of bids submitted.

1. Loan Pog! Purchase

The Potential Acquirer is: Torrey Pines Bank, San Diego CA
(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools
100  Construction & Land Development: Commercial _33 90% of Book Value.
200 Construction & Land Development: Residential 33 90 % of Book Value.

300 Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1)33.90% of Book
Value.

400 Conventional 1-1 Family Property 33.90% of Book Value.

500 Equity Lines — Secured by 1-4 Family Property 33.90% of Book Value.
600  Multiple Family Residence 33.90% of Book Value.

700  Non-Farm, Non-Residential 33.90% of Book Value.

800 Commercial & Industrial 33.90% of Book Value.

900  Small Business Administration 33.90% of Book Value.

1000 Consumer — Performing 33,90% of Book Valuc.

1100 Non-Performing _ 33.90 % of Rock Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids
Bids on the above Loan Pools:

[X] arelinked to each other
[_] arenotlinked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
Tanuary 28, 2009, 3.18 PM Culver City, CA



This is bid number

of bids submitted.
IM. Resulting Institntion Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)
A. If the Potential Acquirer’s Bid is accepted:
(i)  the resulting financial institution will be a
X __bank
thrift
(i)  the resulting financial institution
will
X will not
involve a de novo institution
(iii)  the resulting financial institution
X will
will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer
B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the

resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

Torrey PInes Bank

and such institution will be a:

national bank

state member bank

state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

NERRR N

C. To be compleicd only if a holding company 1s involved:

Name of holding company: _Western Alliance Bancorporation

4

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28. 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Address of holding company:__ 2700 West Sahara Avenue . _
Las Vegas, NV 89102

The holding company wH-be a:

bank holding company
_____thrift holding company

IV.  Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: _Dale Gibbons

Title: CFO. Western Alliance

Address: 2700 West Sahara Ave.

Las Vegas, NV 89102

Telephone:  702-252-6236 (office)

702-370-7226 __ (other)
Facsimile: 702-252-3648

cc: Name:

V. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potentiul Acyuirer represents and warrants thal it has exceuted and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
5

Bid Form 022131 Alliancc Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



This is bid number ]
of _ bids submtted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certification (“Certification™) and that all information provided and
reptesentations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreeinent aud its cligibility to purchase asscls and ability to cxcoute o
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immcdiately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifics that (i) the Potential
Acquirer hag full power and avthority fo submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessaty with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sign on behalf of the institution or group has been submitted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer
“/-""

Torrey Pines Bank 4~ -

v

(signatureﬁ ’

Name: _Phil Fowler

Title: _Chief Financial Officer

Date: _February 3. 2008

Bid Form 022131 Alliniwy Dovk
Junuary 28, 2009, 3:13 PM Culver City. CA



To:

Page 7 of 40

2008-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. — Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention:  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank"™)

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Poteritial Acquirers ("Instructions”) and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (it) a Loan
Sale.

Bid Form 022131 1 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To:

Page 8 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17.53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 4 bids submitted.

L Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
liabilities of the Institution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of Assuned Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilities of the Institution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "( )" '

A, The bid amount is:

All Deposits 1.47 % of Assumed Deposits. (*)
Insured Deposits Only % of Assumed Deposits.
B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION II)

[ 1 Exercise the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools
{__] Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
[__] Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assumed that the loan pool bids are net linked to the deposit franchise bid.

IZI Waive the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools

(*)_This bid amount applies to all deposits to be assumed less assumed brokered
deposits. No premium is offered with respect to brokered deposits.

Bid Form 022131 2 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To: Page 9 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 4 bids submitted.

1. Loan Pool Purchase

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California.
(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools

100 Construction & Land Development: Commercial ______ % of Book Value.

200  Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

300 Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1) % of Book
Value.

400  Conventional 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

500  Equity Lines — Secured by 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

600 Multiple Family Residence _______% of Book Value.

700 Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

800  Commercial & Industrial ____ % of Book Value.

900  Small Business Administration % of Book Value.

1000 Consumer — Performing % of Book Value.

1100  Non-Performing % of Book Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

[ ] arelinked to each other
[ ] arenot linked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

Bid Form 022131 3 Ailiance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To:

Page 10 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number |
of 4 bids submitted.

1118 Resulting Institution Tnformation (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:

(D the resulting financial institution will be a
bank
_ thiift
(ii) the resulting financial institution
will

will not

involve a de novo institution
(il the resulting financial institution
g
will

wili not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

California Bank & Trust

and such institution will be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

I el

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:
Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation
Bid Form 022131 4 Alltance Bank

January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



2009-02-03 17:17 53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number |
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:
E bank holding company
thrift holding company
Iv.  Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for thé Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President, Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive, Eighth Floor

Qalland, California 94612

Telephone:  510.808.1662 (office)
SApANeN c:i! (other)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc:  Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

V1. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchasc assets and able to execute a

Bid Form 022131 5 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To: Page 12 0of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number |
of 4 bids submitted.

Purchaser Bligibility Certification (“Certification™) and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute 2
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is & successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirey, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigred has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

esolution authormn v the ub ission of the bld d dllthI A\ ng 1 thiy representative o
1 I h bmitted

Printed Name of Potentia! Acquirer

California Bank & Trust

by Detvary U
{signaturc) )

" Name: Dennis Uyernura

Title: Managing Director / Chief Finaneial Officer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Forra 022431 6 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To. Page 130f40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: " Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
: 1601 Bryan St. — Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention:  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank™)

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to

acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (ii) a Loan
Sale.

Bid Form 022131 1 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To: Page 14 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

I Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
Habilities of the Institution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilities of the Institution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "()".

A, The bid amount is:
All Deposits % of Assumed Deposits.
Insured Deposits Only 1.33 % of Assumed Deposits. (*)
B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION 1I)

[ ] Exercise the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools
[__1Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
[__1Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assumed that the loan pool bids are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

@ Waive the option to purchase certain or all L.oan Pools

(*) This bid amount applies to all deposits to be assumed less assumed brokered
deposits. No premium is offered with respect to brokered deposits.

Bid Form 022131 2 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To:

Page 15 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT)

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

1. Loan Pool Purchase

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California.

(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools

100 Construction & Land Development: Commercial % of Book Value.

200  Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

300  Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1) % of Book
Value.

400  Conventional 1-4 Family Property ______% of Book Value.

500  Equity Lines — Secured by !-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

600  Muitiple Family Residence % of Book Value.

700 Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

800  Commercial & Industrial % of Book Value.

900  Small Business Administration % of Book Value.

1000 Consumer — Performing ______ % of Book Value.

1100 Non-Performing % of Book Value.

A, Note: Linked Bids

Bid Form 022131

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

[ 1 arelinked to each other
[ ] arenot linked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

3 Alliance Bank

January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA

12023799839 From: Brian Alprin



To:

Page 16 of 40 2008-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

IIL. Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" whete and as appropriate})

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:
0) the resulting financial institution will be a
bank
- thrift
(i) the resulting financial institution
will

will not

~ involve a de novo institution
(ii1) the resulting financial institution

will

_ willnot
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

California Bank & Trust

and such institution will be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

T e

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:
Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation
Bid Form 022131 4 Alliance Bank

January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To.  Page 17 of 40 2008-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:

IZ} bank holding company

thrift holding company
Iv. Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President, Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive. Eighth Floor

Qakland, California 94612

Telephone;  510.808.1662 (office)
ORONEED cc!! (other)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Momis LLP, 202.776.7820

V1. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrecs that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will exocute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a

Bid Form 022131 5 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To:

Page 18 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid pumber 2
of 4 bids submitted.

Purchaser Bligibility Certification (“Certification™) and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, inciuding, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, o behalf of the Potentinl Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
ign on behalf of the institution up has b ubmitted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

California Bank & Trust

By: MQ LL/IMA»»————

(signature) J

Name: Dennis Uyemura

Title: Managing Director / Chief Financinl Officer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Form 022131 6 Aliance Bank
Jannary 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



To:

Page 19 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799838 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. — Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention:  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions”) and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption (Whole Bank) with
Loss Share Agreement.

Bid Form 022131 1 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To:

Page 20 of 40

|

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT)

‘This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

Transaction # 1 — All Deposits and Unsecured Liabilities

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
EDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in anv form will be treated as a
live bid of $0.

A. The bid amount is:

Bid Form 022131 2 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA

12023799839 From: Brian Alprin



To:

Page 21 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

Transaction # 2 — All Deposits

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a
live bid of $0,

A. The bid amount is: ($24,500,000) ,

Bid Form 022131 3 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA
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To

Page 22 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

Transaction # 3 — Insured Deposits Only

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Namg City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a
live bid of $0.

A, The bid amount is: . )

Bid Form 022131 4 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To: Page 23 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799838 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

111. Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A,

If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial institution will be a
bank
: thrift
(i) the resulting financial institution
will

will not

involve a de novo institution
(iii)  the resulting financial institution
will

will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be
California Bank & Trust
and such institution will be a:
____;_ national bank
state member bank
state non member bank
m—' federal savings bank
i state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)
C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:
Name of holding company: Zions Bancerporation

Bid Form 022131
January 7, 2009

5 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



2009-02-03 17:17.53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:

El bank holding company

thrift holding company
1v. Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alyin [.ee

Title: Senior Vice President, Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive, Eighth Floor
Oakland, California 94612
Telephone:  510.808.1662 (office)

IR cc!! (other)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

VI. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shail occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Eligibility Certification (“Certification™) and that all information provided and

Bid Form 022131 6 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

1 This is bid number 3
i of 4 bids submitted.

representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability 10 execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and. do not fail to state any
fact required to make the infonmation contained therein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FIDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

sign on behalf of the institution or group has been submitred with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

Californin Bank & Trust

By: rb W { A
(signature) (_/

Name: Dennis Uyemura

Title: Managing Director / Chief Financial Officer

Date. February 2, 2009

Bid Form 022131 7 Alhanee Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To:

Page 26 of 40

2008-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin
This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.
EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM
TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation

1601 Bryan St. — Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention;  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Aliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption (Whole Bank) with
Loss Share Agrecment.

Bid Form 022131 1 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To:

Page 27 of 40

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitied.

Transaction # 1 — All Deposits and Unsecured Liabilities

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assune certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a

live bid of $0.

A. The bid amount is:

Bid Form 022131 2 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To: Page 28 of 40

I1.

2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

Transaction # 2 — All Deposits

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
Jeave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a
live bid of $0.

A. The bid amount is:

Bid Form 02213} 3 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To: Page 29 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

I Transaction # 3 — Insured Deposits Only

The Potential Acquirer is: Califoruia Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
{Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC: for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain labilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write “no bid". A bid of zerpin any form will be treated as a

live bid of $0.
A. The bid amount is: ($9,900,000)
Bid Form 022131 4 Alliance Bank

January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To: Page 30 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.
I Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)
A. If the Potential Acquirer’s Bid is accepted:
® the resulting financial institution will be a
E bank
~ thrift
(ii) the resulting financial institution
will

— will not

involve a de novo institution
(iii)  the resulting financial institution
will

will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

California Bank & Trust

and such institution will be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

] e

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:
Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation
Bid Form 022131 ) Alliance Bank

January 7, 2009 Culyer City, CA



2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:

bank holding company
thrift bolding company

IVv. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President. Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive, Eighth Floor

Oakland, California 94612

Telephone:  510.808.1662 (office)

e i (other)

Facsimile: 510,808.1640

cc:  Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

V1. Consummation of T ransaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Eligibility Certification (“Certification™) and that all information provided and

Bid Form 022131 6 Alliance Bank
January 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



To: Page 32 of 40 2009-02-03 17:17:53 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid nwumber 4
of 4 bids submitted.

representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not {imited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained iherein not misleading. The Potential Acguirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to subrmnit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (if) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquiver.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sigm on behalf of the jnstitution or group bas been submijtted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

California Bank & Trust
By: —D"Wv'm ' LW“‘N——“
(signature) O

Name: Dennis UGyemura

Title: Managing Director / Chief Financial Officer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Form 022131 7 Alliance Bank
lanuary 7, 2009 Culver City, CA



Feb.

2

2009 5

TO:

FROM:

BID FOR:

L04PM

PWRB Century City 310-201-0498 No. 0211

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32123
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention:  Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

_Pacific Western Bank - 'Vie Santoro

Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank™) _ ppg-37

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"}), in accordance with the
Tnstructions to Potential Acquirers (“Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to

acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (ii) a Loan
" Sale.

P,

3



Feb.

2. 2009 5:04PM PWB Century City 31G-201-0498 No. 0211 P

This is bid number

of bids submitted.

I, . Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: _ Pacific Wesatern Bank, San Dieqo, CA .
{Name, City, State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Bach Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premtum or as a discount. A prerpium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from 2 positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
liabilities of the Institution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting froma
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume cextain liabilities of the Institution, Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "( )",

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits ——=—— % of Assumed De¢posits.
Insuved Deposits Only 0.15 9 of Assumed Deposifs.

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise
(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION II)

[ 1 Exercise the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools
[__]Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
[__1Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assumed that the loan pool bids are pot linked to the deposit franchise bid.

[_] Waive the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culvee City, CA

4



Feb. 2.0 2009 5:04PM  PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No. 0211 F. 5

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

1. Loan Pool Purchase PACIFIC WESTERN BANK MAKES NO BIDS ON ANY LOAN

ThePotentialAcqulrerls: Pacific Western Bank, San Diego, CA .
(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools
100  Construction & Land Development: Commercial % of Book Value.
. 200 Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.
) 300 Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1) % of Book

Value.
400  Conventional 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.
500  Equity Lines — Secured by 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

600  Multiple Family Residence % of Book Value.

700 Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

800 Commercial & Indusirial % of Book Value.
900  Small Business Administration % of Book Value.
1000 Consumer — Performing % of Book Value,

1100 Non-Performing % of Book Value.

A, Note: Linked Bids
Bids on the above Loan Pools:

[ ] arelinked to each other
{1 arenotlinked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



Fet. 2. 2009 5:04PM  PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No. 0211 P

6

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

III. Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:
()  the resulting financial institution will be a

% bank
thrift

(i)  the resulting financial institution

will
X willnot
involve a de novo institution

(i)  the resulting financial institution

¥ will
will not ‘
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

Pacific Western Bank

and such institution will be a:

national bank

state member bank

state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

NERENSE

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company:

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
Janpary 23, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



Feb.

1

2006 5:05PM  PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No. 0211 P
This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Address of holding company:

The holding company will be a:

bank holding company
thrift holding company

IV.  Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name; Victor R. Santoro

Title; Executive Vice President

Address: 10250 Constellation Blvd, Suilte 1640

Los Angeles, CA 90067

Telephome: (310} 728-1021 (office)

(310) 728-1026 (other)

Facsimile: (310) 201-0498

cc: Namc: Jared Wolff

V. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and waivants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a

5

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28,2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



Feb. 2. 200G 5:05PM PWE Century City 310-201-0498 ‘ No. 0211 P

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certification (“Certification”) and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misleading, The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery. :

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sien on behalf of the institution or group has been submitted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

Pacific Wesﬁern Bank

Name: Victor R. Santoro

Title: Executive Vice Pregident

Date: February 3, 2009

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2005, 3:18 FM Culver City, CA



90943812120 P.g2

FEB-D2-2PP9 16:83 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK
EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM
TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: C.Tizews TBusiweis Bawvec

BID FOR: Alliance Bank

Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (ii) 2 Loan
Sale.



9994812120 P.a3

FEB-P2-2089 16:83 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK

This is bid number |
of { bids submitted.

L Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential-Acquireris: EITI2EW S B“:m&s wum[df aMm,
(Name, City, State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must

ve an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive doltar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
labilities of the Institution. A discount js a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed D. 0sits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilities of the Institution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis HOW

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits % of Assumed Deposits.

Insured Deposits Only 5. O% of Assumed Deposits,
——==t2=79 03 ASsumed Deposits,

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the D osit Franchise
(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION I¥)

[ ] Exercise the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools
[__] Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
[__]Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assumed that the loan pool bids are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

%} Waive the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools

Bid I'orm 022131 Alliance Bank
lanuary 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



FEB-B2-2009 16:83

CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK 9994312120

P.B4

This is bid number _
of [ bids submitted.

I1. Loan Pool Purchase

The Potential Acquirer is:

(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools

100 Construction & Land Development: Commercial % of Book Value.

200 Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

300  Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1) % of Book
Value.

400  Conventional 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

500  Equity Lines — Secured by 14 Family Property % of Book Value.

600  Multiple Family Residence % of Book Value.

700  Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

800 Commercial & Industrial % of Book Value.

900  Small Business Administration ____% of Book Value.

1000 Consumer ~ Performing % of Book Value.

1100 Non-Performing % of Book Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bid Form 022131

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

[_] are linked to each other
[_] arenot linked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

Alliance Bank

January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



FEB-02-2003 16:04 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK 98948121208 P.85

This is bid number /
of _}  bids submitted.

III.  Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)
A. If the Potential Acquirer’s Bid is accepted:
() the resulting financial institution will be a
_¥__bank
T thrif
(i1)  the resulting financial institution
_will

¥ will not

involve a de novo institution
(iii)  the resulting financial institution
will

will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

CITIRESS But,o&IS B i

and such institution will be a:

national bank

state member bank

state non member bank

federal savings bank

state savings bank

federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

RERRR SN

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company:

Bid Form 02213} Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



FEB-B82-2003 16:04 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK 5994512120
This is bid number /
of __/ bids submitted.
Address of holding company:
The holding company will be a:
bank holding company
thrift holding company
IV.  Contact
The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquiret:
Name: _E a2 AR D . TR EBRIcH, TR
Title: _EV P ~ & Fo
Address: POl MNonTH HHAVEN MHIEROKE
DT 0, e M S/FY
Telephone: 0%~ #€2~31¥F (office)
(other)
Facsimile: @20%-4¢4%1-2120
cc: Name: D B e CH
V. Consummation of Transaction

P.06

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation

that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepied, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place

as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrants that it has executed and delivered to the

Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a

Bid Form 02213)
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM

S

Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



FEB-D2-2083 16:04 CITIZENS BUSINESS BANK 9994812120 P.97

This is bid number _§
of __| bids submitted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certification (““Certification™) and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the information contained therein not misieading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sigh on behalf of the institution or group has been submitted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer

CrTITew [RBug.ogxs Bave

By: G o) WZ“,__.,

(signature)

Name: EDsd e b 7, BicHMR 14’7', g ')
Title: EVL -~ K,
Date: p-‘—‘-w—-—; 2 , 2009

Bid Form 022131 Alliance Bank
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM Culver City, CA



